
 

 1 

Employment and Work Readiness Assistance 

Amendment (No 2) 2021 

 

This instrument is made under section 101(1) of the Social Security Act 

2018 by the Minister for Social Development and Employment.  

 

Contents 

1 Title 1 
2 Commencement 1 
3 Programme amended 1 
4 Schedule amended 1 
  

______ 

Instrument 

1 Title 

This instrument is the Employment and Work Readiness 

Assistance Amendment (No 2) 2021. 

 

2 Commencement 

This instrument comes into force on 26 October 2021. 

 

3 Programme amended  

 This instrument amends the Employment Work Readiness 

Assistance Programme1 (as established and approved on 6 

March 2014).    

 

4 Schedule amended  

Amend Schedule 1: 

(1) At clause 5B in the Schedule, delete “$2,600” and replace 
with “$5,200”. 

(2) At clause 5B in the Schedule, delete “13 weeks” and replace 
with “26 weeks”. 

 

   

 

 

                                                   
1 New Zealand Gazette, 13 March 2014, page 837 



 

 2 

 

Minister for Social Development and Employment 

 

At Auckland this 18th day of October 2021 

 

 

 

______ 

Explanatory Note 

This note is not part of the instrument, but is intended to indicate its 

general effect. 

This instrument, which comes into force on 26 October 2021, amends 

the Employment and Work Readiness Assistance Programme. 

This instrument amends the Schedule by increasing the duration of 

accommodation assistance available for people offered employment 

under the New Zealand Seasonal Work Assistance Scheme, to support 
them to undertake seasonal work in New Zealand.  

 


